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Lesson 1

Subjects and Predicates
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Begin reading a book of your choice about Christopher Columbus.

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Identify subjects and predicates in sentences.

	■�	 List subjects and predicates and compose original sentences.

	■�	 Edit and proofread writing assignment.

Learning Assessment
These assessment rubrics are intended to help track student progress throughout the year. Please 
remember that these skills continue to develop over time. Parents and teachers can use this space to 
make notes about the learning the student demonstrates or skills that need work.

SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Differentiates between subject and 
predicate

Demonstrates editing skills

Demonstrates proofreading skills

Reads course material 
independently 
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LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Christopher Columbus book 

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

1
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Lesson 2

Independent and Dependent 
Clauses
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Finish reading your Christopher Columbus book. 

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Identify dependent and independent clauses.

	■�	 Compose sentences and indicate subjects and predicates.

	■�	 Edit and proofread writing assignment.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Differentiates between dependent 
and independent clauses

Differentiates between subject and 
predicate

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Demonstrates editing skills

Demonstrates proofreading skills

Reads course material 
independently 
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LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Christopher Columbus book

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

2
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Lesson 3

Compound Subjects and Predicates
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Begin reading 1607: A New Look at Jamestown and 1621: A New Look at Thanksgiving.

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Compose sentences with simple subjects and predicates.

	■�	 Compose sentences with compound subjects and predicates.

Learning Assessment
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Constructs simple sentences with 
simple and compound subjects and 
predicates

Differentiates between dependent 
and independent clauses

Differentiates between subject and 
predicate

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Demonstrates editing skills

Demonstrates proofreading skills

Reads course material 
independently 
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LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

1607: A New Look at Jamestown

1621: A New Look at Thanksgiving

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

3
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Lesson 4

Compound Sentences and 
Conjunctions
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Finish reading 1607: A New Look at Jamestown and 1621: A New Look at Thanksgiving.

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Compose compound sentences using conjunctions.

	■�	 Identify subjects and predicates in sentences.

Learning Assessment
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Uses conjunctions to construct 
compound sentences

Constructs simple sentences with 
simple and compound subjects and 
predicates

Differentiates between dependent 
and independent clauses

Differentiates between subject and 
predicate

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Demonstrates editing skills

Demonstrates proofreading skills

Reads course material 
independently 
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LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

1607: A New Look at Jamestown

1621: A New Look at Thanksgiving

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

4
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Lesson 5

Complex Sentences
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Begin reading The Witch of Blackbird Pond. 

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Identify dependent and independent clauses in complex sentences.

	■�	 Combine dependent and independent clauses into complex sentences.

	■�	 Compose original complex sentences.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Combines dependent and 
independent clauses into complex 
sentences

Uses conjunctions to construct 
compound sentences

Constructs simple sentences with 
simple and compound subjects and 
predicates

Identifies dependent and 
independent clauses

Identifies subjects and predicates 
in sentences

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Demonstrates editing skills

Demonstrates proofreading skills
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

The Witch of Blackbird Pond

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

5



Grade 5 English Assignment Summaries and Learning Assessments

12	 Oak Meadow

Lesson 6

Sentence Fragments
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Continue reading The Witch of Blackbird Pond. 

	■�	 Look up unknown words in the dictionary.

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Transform sentence fragments into complete sentences.

	■�	 Repair run-on sentences.

	■�	 Revise previous writing to fix run-on sentences.

Learning Assessment
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Identifies sentence fragments and 
transforms into complete 
sentences

Identifies and repairs run-on 
sentences

Combines dependent and 
independent clauses into complex 
sentences

Uses conjunctions to construct 
compound sentences

Constructs simple sentences with 
simple and compound subjects and 
predicates

Identifies dependent and 
independent clauses

Identifies subjects and predicates 
in sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Demonstrates editing skills

Demonstrates proofreading skills

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

The Witch of Blackbird Pond

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

6
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Lesson 7

Idea Webs and Outlines
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Correct sentences with faulty capitalization.

	■�	 Revise previous writing to correct capitalization errors.

	■�	 Create an idea web and outline.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Uses idea web to create an outline

Identifies main ideas and 
supporting details in outline form

Identifies and corrects errors in 
capitalization

Identifies sentence fragments and 
transforms into complete 
sentences

Identifies and repairs run-on 
sentences

Identifies dependent and 
independent clauses

Identifies subjects and predicates 
in sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Demonstrates editing skills

Demonstrates proofreading skills

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

The Witch of Blackbird Pond

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

7
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Lesson 8

Nouns and Possessives
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Finish reading The Witch of Blackbird Pond.

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Write sentences using common and proper nouns.

	■�	 Identify different types of nouns.

Learning Assessment
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Differentiates between common 
and proper nouns

Forms singular and plural nouns

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Identifies dependent and 
independent clauses

Identifies subjects and predicates 
in sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

The Witch of Blackbird Pond

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

8
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Lesson 9

Adjectives and Adverbs
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Begin reading Early Thunder.

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Make lists of adjectives and adverbs.

	■�	 Write a story or essay using adjectives and adverbs.

	■�	 Identify adjectives and adverbs.

Learning Assessment
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Identifies and uses adjectives and 
adverbs

Differentiates between common 
and proper nouns

Forms singular and plural nouns

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Identifies dependent and 
independent clauses
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Identifies subjects and predicates 
in sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Early Thunder

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

9
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Lesson 10

Syllables
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Divide words into syllables.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Identify words with varying numbers of syllables.

	■�	 Apply spelling rules to form plural nouns.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Divides words into syllables

Applies spelling rules to form plural 
nouns

Identifies and uses adjectives and 
adverbs

Differentiates between common 
and proper nouns

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Identifies dependent and 
independent clauses
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Identifies subjects and predicates 
in sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Early Thunder

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

10
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Lesson 11

Short Story Writing
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Begin writing a short story about the American Revolution.

	■�	 Identify different sentence types.

	■�	 Write examples of different sentence types.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Identifies different sentence types 
(declarative, exclamatory, 
interrogative, imperative)

Divides words into syllables
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Applies spelling rules to form plural 
nouns

Identifies and uses adjectives and 
adverbs

Differentiates between common 
and proper nouns

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Identifies dependent and 
independent clauses

Identifies subjects and predicates 
in sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Early Thunder

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

11
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Lesson 12

Quotations and Citations
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Finish reading Early Thunder.

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Identify and apply punctuation to direct quotations.

	■�	 Turn indirect quotations into direct quotations.

	■�	 Apply correct capitalization to direct quotations.

	■�	 Complete your short story about the American Revolution.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Applies correct punctuation and 
capitalization to direct quotations

Identifies different sentence types 
(declarative, exclamatory, 
interrogative, imperative)
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Divides words into syllables

Applies spelling rules to form plural 
nouns

Identifies and uses adjectives and 
adverbs

Differentiates between common 
and proper nouns

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Identifies dependent and 
independent clauses

Identifies subjects and predicates 
in sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Early Thunder

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

12
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Lesson 13

Plural Nouns
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Apply spelling rules to form plural nouns.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Displays memorization and 
recitation skills

Applies correct punctuation and 
capitalization to direct quotations

Identifies different sentence types 
(declarative, exclamatory, 
interrogative, imperative)

Divides words into syllables

Applies spelling rules to form plural 
nouns

Identifies and uses adjectives and 
adverbs

Differentiates between common 
and proper nouns
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Identifies dependent and 
independent clauses

Identifies subjects and predicates 
in sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

13
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Lesson 14

Writing and Giving a Speech
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Practice punctuating dialogue.

	■�	 Compose a speech to a group of colonists.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Applies correct punctuation and 
capitalization to direct quotations

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Identifies dependent and 
independent clauses

Identifies subjects and predicates 
in sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

14
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Lesson 15

Base Words and Prefixes
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Identify base words and prefixes.

	■�	 Compose sentences using words with prefixes.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Identifies base words and prefixes

Applies correct punctuation and 
capitalization to direct quotations

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Identifies dependent and 
independent clauses

Identifies subjects and predicates 
in sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

15
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Lesson 16

Base Words and Suffixes
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Read a book about George Washington.

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Write notes for a book report.

	■�	 Identify base words and suffixes.

	■�	 Compose sentences using words with suffixes.

	■�	 Identify base words.

	■�	 Create words using prefixes and suffixes.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Identifies base words and prefixes

Applies correct punctuation and 
capitalization to direct quotations

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Identifies dependent and 
independent clauses

Identifies subjects and predicates 
in sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

16



Grade 5 English Assignment Summaries and Learning Assessments

34	 Oak Meadow

Lesson 17

Verb Forms
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Write a book report.

	■�	 Compose sentences using present tense, past tense, and past participle verb forms.

	■�	 Form plural nouns.

	■�	 Differentiate between different sentence types.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Identifies and correctly uses 
present tense, past tense, and past 
participle verb forms

Identifies base words, prefixes, and 
suffixes

Applies correct punctuation and 
capitalization to direct quotations

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Identifies dependent and 
independent clauses

Identifies subjects and predicates 
in sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

17
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Lesson 18

Prepositions and Prepositional 
Phrases
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Form plural nouns.

	■�	 Form sentences that include prepositions.

	■�	 Identify prepositions in sentences.

	■�	 Practice using different verb forms.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Identifies and correctly uses 
present tense, past tense, and past 
participle verb forms

Identifies and uses prepositions 
and prepositional phrases

Identifies base words, prefixes, and 
suffixes

Applies correct punctuation and 
capitalization to direct quotations

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Identifies dependent and 
independent clauses

Identifies subjects and predicates 
in sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

Free choice book:
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SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

18
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Lesson 19

Contractions and Possessives
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Begin reading Ben and Me.

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Form contractions.

	■�	 Identify words that make contractions.

	■�	 Place apostrophes in misspelled words to form contractions.

	■�	 Use apostrophes to form plural possessive nouns.

	■�	 Use singular and plural possessive nouns in sentences.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar



Grade 5 English Assignment Summaries and Learning Assessments

40	 Oak Meadow

SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Identifies and correctly uses 
present tense, past tense, and past 
participle verb forms

Identifies and uses prepositions 
and prepositional phrases

Identifies base words, prefixes, and 
suffixes

Applies correct punctuation and 
capitalization to direct quotations

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Identifies dependent and 
independent clauses

Identifies subjects and predicates 
in sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Ben and Me

Free choice book:

Free choice book:
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SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

19
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Lesson 20

Punctuation
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Form plural nouns.

	■�	 Correct faulty sentences to make them complete.

	■�	 Write sentences to demonstrate punctuation rules.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Ben and Me

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

20
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Lesson 21

Five-Paragraph Essay
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Finish reading Ben and Me. 

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Form singular and plural possessive nouns.

	■�	 Write sentences to demonstrate different verb forms.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Essay writing: Follows format for 
five-paragraph essay

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Ben and Me

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

21
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Lesson 22

Auxiliary Verbs, Prefixes, and 
Suffixes
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Begin reading Children of the Wild West and Buffalo Bird Girl: A Hidatsa Story. 

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Write sentences to demonstrate different verb forms.

	■�	 Write a story using many words with prefixes and suffixes.

	■�	 Identify words with prefixes and suffixes.

Learning Assessment
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Essay writing: Follows format for 
five-paragraph essay

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Identifies base words, prefixes, and 
suffixes

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Children of the Wild West

Buffalo Bird Girl: A Hidatsa Story

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

22
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Lesson 23

Grammar Review
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Identify subjects and predicates in sentences.

	■�	 Compose simple, compound, and complex sentences.

	■�	 Create sentences and identify subjects and predicates. 

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Essay writing: Follows format for 
five-paragraph essay

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Identifies base words, prefixes, and 
suffixes

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Children of the Wild West

Buffalo Bird Girl: A Hidatsa Story

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

23



Grade 5 English Assignment Summaries and Learning Assessments

50	 Oak Meadow

Lesson 24

Homophones
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Use notes from reading to create an outline.

	■�	 Write sentences using different types of adverbs.

	■�	 Use homophone pairs correctly in sentences.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Essay writing: Follows format for 
five-paragraph essay

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Uses homophone pairs correctly in 
sentences

Identifies different types of 
adverbs

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Forms singular and plural 
possessive nouns

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Children of the Wild West

Buffalo Bird Girl: A Hidatsa Story

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

24
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Lesson 25

More Homophones
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Finish reading Children of the Wild West and Buffalo Bird Girl: A Hidatsa Story.

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Use homophone pairs correctly in sentences.

	■�	 Write an imaginary conversation.

Learning Assessment
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Essay writing: Follows format for 
five-paragraph essay

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Uses homophone pairs correctly in 
sentences

Identifies different types of 
adverbs

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Forms simple, compound, and 
complex sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Children of the Wild West

Buffalo Bird Girl: A Hidatsa Story

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

25
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Lesson 26

Double Negatives
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Begin reading The Birchbark House. 

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Identify and correct double negatives.

	■�	 Add apostrophes to create contractions and possessives.

	■�	 Repair run-on sentences.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Essay writing: Follows format for 
five-paragraph essay

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Uses homophone pairs correctly in 
sentences

Identifies and corrects double 
negatives

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Repairs run-on sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

The Birchbark House

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

26
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Lesson 27

Creative Writing
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Create a new scene based on the reading and tell it aloud.

	■�	 Create sentences using homophones.

	■�	 Write a descriptive paragraph.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Essay writing: Follows format for 
five-paragraph essay

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Uses homophone pairs correctly in 
sentences

Uses adjectives and adverbs to 
write a descriptive paragraph

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Repairs run-on sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

The Birchbark House

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

27
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Lesson 28

Synonyms and Antonyms
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Finish reading The Birchbark House.

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Compare modern life and pioneer living.

	■�	 Identify antonyms for a list of words.

	■�	 Identify synonyms for a list of words.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Essay writing: Follows format for 
five-paragraph essay

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Identifies synonyms and antonyms

Uses adjectives and adverbs to 
write a descriptive paragraph

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Repairs run-on sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

The Birchbark House

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

28
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Lesson 29

Grammar Review
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Begin reading Freedom Train: The Story of Harriet Tubman. 

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Form plural nouns.

	■�	 Write a variety of sentences and identify adjectives and adverbs.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Essay writing: Follows format for 
five-paragraph essay

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Identifies synonyms and antonyms

Uses adjectives and adverbs to 
write a descriptive paragraph

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Repairs run-on sentences

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Freedom Train: The Story of Harriet 
Tubman

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

29
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Lesson 30

Writing Business Letters
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Finish reading Freedom Train: The Story of Harriet Tubman. 

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Revise, edit, and proofread assignment about slavery and the abolitionist movement.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Demonstrates ability to write a 
business letter using the correct 
format

Essay writing: Follows format for 
five-paragraph essay

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Identifies synonyms and antonyms

Uses adjectives and adverbs to 
write a descriptive paragraph

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Repairs run-on sentences

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Freedom Train: The Story of Harriet 
Tubman

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

30
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Lesson 31

Biography
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Choose a biography to read.

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Demonstrate the correct usage of different words.

	■�	 Form plural nouns.

	■�	 Use homophones in sentences.

Learning Assessment
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Demonstrates ability to write a 
business letter using the correct 
format

Essay writing: Follows format for 
five-paragraph essay

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Identifies synonyms and antonyms

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Biography of choice:

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

31
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Lesson 32

Poetry
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Divide words into syllables.

	■�	 Create sentences using prepositions.

	■�	 Write a poem.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Demonstrates ability to write a 
business letter using the correct 
format

Essay writing: Follows format for 
five-paragraph essay

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Follows specific poetry format 
when writing a poem

Divides words into syllables

Identifies and uses prepositions 
and prepositional phrases

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Biography of choice:

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

32
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Lesson 33

Capitalization and Punctuation
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Alphabetize and define vocabulary words, and use them in sentences.

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Correct errors in capitalization and punctuation.

	■�	 List different types of nouns.

	■�	 Review information in the English manual.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Demonstrates ability to write a 
business letter using the correct 
format

Essay writing: Follows format for 
five-paragraph essay

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Biography of choice:

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

33
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Lesson 34

Grammar Review
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Take a spelling quiz.

	■�	 Write a summary of a biography.

	■�	 Continue reviewing the English manual.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Demonstrates ability to write a 
business letter using the correct 
format

Essay writing: Follows format for 
five-paragraph essay

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing
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SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Biography of choice:

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

SPELLING TEST Score  
# correct/total # Notes

34
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Lesson 35

Grammar Final Exam
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Complete a grammar final exam.

Learning Assessment 
SKILLS Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Demonstrates ability to write a 
business letter using the correct 
format

Essay writing: Follows format for 
five-paragraph essay

Creative writing: Uses descriptive 
writing to develop characters and 
setting

Creative writing: Conveys a plot 
with story problem, climax, and 
resolution

Creative writing: Conveys creative, 
original story ideas

Writing skills: Displays good note-
taking skills, identifying key ideas 
and connecting themes

Writing skills: Uses an outline to 
identify main ideas and supporting 
details 

Writing skills: Revises writing to 
improve clarity and flow

Writing skills: Edits writing to 
correct errors in spelling, 
punctuation, capitalization, and 
grammar

Writing skills: Proofreads final 
version of writing

Demonstrates awareness of 
punctuation rules



Grade 5 English Assignment Summaries and Learning Assessments

Oak Meadow	 73

SKILLS (continued) Developing Consistent Competent Notes

Uses apostrophes correctly to form 
contractions and possessives

Uses dictionary to find unfamiliar 
words

Alphabetizes list of words

Writes clear definitions

Uses words in sentences that show 
word meaning

Reads course material 
independently 

LITERATURE Read aloud 
by adult

Read by 
child, in 

progress

Read by 
child, 

completed 
Notes

Free choice book:

Free choice book:

Free choice book:
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Lesson 36

Book List
ASSIGNMENT SUMMARY

	■�	 Make a list of books you have read.
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